
Report on VECC Swachhata Action Plan (SAP)  
for the period from July to September, 2022 

 
In tune with the year-long swachhata activities, VECC Swachhata committee is also committed to the execution of 
various programme initiated by the Government of India. Azadi Ka Amrit Mahotsav was such an initiative of the 
government to celebrate and commemorate 75 years of independence and the glorious history of its people, culture and 
achievements. This celebration is dedicated to the people of India who have not only been instrumental in bringing India 
in its evolutionary journey but also hold within them the power and potential to enable Prime Minister's vision of 
activating India 2.0 powered by the spirit of Aatmanirbhar Bharat. VECC Swachhata Committee too carried out various 
events in association with the Azadi Ka Amrit Mahotsav committee of VECC, during the period of DAE iconic week 22-
28 August, 2022. 

BRIKSHAROPAN UTSAB: 

On 22nd August, 2022, VECC Swachhata Committee was instrumental in organizing the BRIKSHAROPAN UTSAB at 
the Medical Cyclotron Facility campus. The extensive tree plantation programme was motivated by the "green campus 
campaign".Around 50 saplings of different varieties including the ones which will grow in the next 75 years were 
planted. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Celebration of BRIKSHAROPAN UTSAB at the Medical Cyclotron Facility campus on 22nd August, 2022 

BONOSRIJON UTSAB: 

On 23rdAugust, 2022, Swachhta Committee took part in a BONOSRIJON UTSAB. The event was also motivated by the 
"green campus campaign". A massive tree plantation program was organized at VECC-Rajarhat campus. More than 250 
number of saplings of local as well as exotic varieties were planted all over the campus. It was also included with the 
deliberation by the dignitaries, cultural programme and distribution of saplings among the participants. 

  



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Celebration of BONOSRIJON UTSAB at the Rajarhat campus on 23rd August, 2022 
 

PUBLIC OUTREACH PROGRAM: 

A public outreach program for school students was organized on 25th August, 2022 at the Meghnad Saha Auditorium. 
About 300 students along with 40 accompanying teachers of 20 different schools from various parts of West Bengal 
participated in the event. The daylong event was organized with popular lectures, demonstration of scientific 
experiments, video show, debate competition and quiz programme. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Organization of Public Outreach Programme at the VECC campus on 25th August, 2022 

  

  

  



OPEN HOUSE VISIT: 

An open house visit to VECC Room Temperature Cyclotron, Super conducting Cyclotron, Radioactive Ion Beam 
Facility and other research laboratories was arranged on 27th August, 2022 for general public upon registration with 
government ID proof. VECC Swachhata Committee actively took part in this special event. The entire campus was 
beautifully decorated with flowers and trees. The committee members were vigilant throughout the entire iconic week 
about the basic cleanliness and sanitization of every corner of the buildings. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 
Organization of Open House Visit at the VECC campus on 25th August, 2022 

 

REGULAR SANITIZATION AND CLEANING WORK: 

Also, during this period of July to September 2022, VECC Swachhata Committee conducted regularly the cleanliness 
drives, sanitization drives and put emphasis on the personal hygiene. The committee took various steps to restrict the 
spread of malaria, dengue and other diseases related to mosquito bites. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Regular sanitization and cleaning work 
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